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Reference: FOI.ICB-2425/008 
 
Subject: ICS/ICB Commissioned Sexual Health Platform 

I can confirm that the ICB does not hold the information requested; please see responses below: 
 

QUESTION RESPONSE 

1. The name of the Sexual Health Platform commissioned 
by the ICS / ICB? 

  
for example INFORM Sexual Health provided by 
INFORM, Lilie proved by Idox and MAXIMS PreView 
solution provided by Maxims 

  
2. The Name of the Provider of the Sexual Health Platform? 
3. The date start date and end date of the current contract? 
4. The name and email of the person within the ICB/ICS that 

is responsible for The Sexual Health Platform ? 

The ICB does not hold this information.   
 
We advise you to contact Bristol City Council who commission sexual 
health services: https://www.bristol.gov.uk/data-protection-
foi/freedom-of-information-foi 

 
The information provided in this response is accurate as of 9 April 2024 and has been approved for release by Sarah Truelove, 
Deputy Chief Executive and Chief Finance Officer for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB. 
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