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Reference: FOI.ICB-2324/407 
 
Subject: Myeloma Service Provision 

I can confirm that the ICB does hold some of the information requested; please see responses below: 
 

QUESTION RESPONSE 

1. As of 1 Jan 2024:  

a. Total population size served by the Integrated Care Board  
b. Number of hospitals providing oncology services  
c. Total number of consultant haematologists employees; 

specialist haematology registrars employed; consultant 
haematologists specialising in multiple myeloma; 
haematology clinical nurse specialists employed and multiple 
myeloma clinical nurse specialists.  

a. Approximately 1.1m 
b. two 
c. The ICB does not hold this information, please contact the Acute 

Trusts directly: 
 
North Bristol NHS Trust (NBT) - https://www.nbt.nhs.uk/about-
us/information-governance/freedom-information/request-
information 
 
University Hospitals Bristol and Weston NHS Foundation Trust 
(UHBW) - https://www.uhbw.nhs.uk/p/how-we-use-your-
data/freedom-of-information-foi-requests 

2. During 2023 (1 Jan – 31 Dec), please provide the:  

a. Total number of multiple myeloma (MM) cases diagnosed 
(Please state which code(s) were used)  

b. If known, how many people were diagnosed with 
smouldering multiple myeloma?  

c. How many in-person haematology-based 
consultation/telephone haematology-based 

The ICB does not hold this information, please contact the Acute 
Trusts directly: 

 
North Bristol NHS Trust (NBT) - https://www.nbt.nhs.uk/about-
us/information-governance/freedom-information/request-information 
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consultations/  video haematology-based consultation took 
place for people diagnosed with MM?  

University Hospitals Bristol and Weston NHS Foundation Trust 
(UHBW) - https://www.uhbw.nhs.uk/p/how-we-use-your-
data/freedom-of-information-foi-requests 

3. During 2023 (1 Jan – 31 Dec):  

 Were multiple myeloma (MM) patients discussed/reviewed at 
a MM specific MDT or general haematology MDT?  

 How frequently did MDT meetings meet?  
 What percentage of MM patients diagnosed in 2023 were 

reviewed/discussed at a MDT?  
 Which professionals/disciplines are represented on MDT 

meetings for MM?  
 What supportive and palliative care services are available for 

MM patients?  

The ICB does not hold this information, please contact the Acute 
Trusts directly: 

 
North Bristol NHS Trust (NBT) - https://www.nbt.nhs.uk/about-
us/information-governance/freedom-information/request-information 

 
University Hospitals Bristol and Weston NHS Foundation Trust 
(UHBW) - https://www.uhbw.nhs.uk/p/how-we-use-your-
data/freedom-of-information-foi-requests 

 
The information provided in this response is accurate as of 9 February 2024 and has been approved for release by Sarah 
Truelove, Deputy Chief Executive and Chief Finance Officer for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB. 


