Reference: FOI.ICB-2324/361

Subject: Pain Services
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I can confirm that the ICB does hold some of the information requested; please see responses below:

QUESTION

RESPONSE

1. Please provide the names of all providers of pain clinics
in the ICB over the past two NHS financial years

2. For each provider, please share the service specification
that is (or was) in place

3. For each provider, please state the role of the clinician
who leads (i.e. is clinically responsible for) the service. |
am not interested in personally identifiable information, |
am interested in the position, e.g. consultant anaesthetist

4. For each provider, please provide the total number of
referrals received in NHS Financial Year 2022/23

5. For each provider, please provide the total number of
referrals received in NHS Financial Year 2023/24 YTD
(please also provide the cut-off date for this data)

6. For each provider, please state how many of the referrals
in NHS Financial Year 2023/24 YTD were made through
the e-referral system (eRS)

7. For each provider, please provide the total number of
patients who started treatment in NHS Financial Year
2022/23

1.

Within the BNSSG ICB area, North Bristol NHS Trust (NBT)
and University Hospitals Bristol and Weston NHS Foundation
Trust (UHBW) provide a pain clinic.

The details of the pain services are published online -
https://remedy.bnssg.icb.nhs.uk/adults/pain-management-and-
cfs/persistent-chronic-pain/

Also, details on what the services will treat can be located as
follows;

UHBW - https://www.uhbristol.nhs.uk/patients-and-
visitors/your-hospitals/other-services-in-bristol/pain-clinic/

NBT - https://www.nbt.nhs.uk/our-services/a-z-services/pain-
clinic

The ICB does not hold this information, we advise you to
contact the providers directly, who are listed above.
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8. For each provider, please provide the total number of NBT: https://www.nbt.nhs.uk/about-us/information-
patients who started treatment in NHS Financial Year governance/freedom-information/request-information
2023/24 YTD (please provide the cut-off date for this UHBW: https://www.uhbw.nhs.uk/p/how-we-use-your-
data) data/freedom-of-information-foi-requests
9. For each provider, please provide the total amount the 4. As above
ICB paid for pain services in NHS Financial Year 5. As above
2022/23 6. All referrals from Primary Care will have been processed via
10.For each provider, please provide the total amount the ERS, all internal referrals within Trusts will not have been — we
ICB paid for pain services in NHS Financial Year 2023/24 do not hold the data in the terms requested.

YTD (please provide the cut-off date for this data) 7. Please refer to point 3
11.For each provider, please provide the current size of the 8. Please refer to point 3
waiting list (e.g. 100 patients) 9. Please refer to point 3
12.For each provider, please provide the current median and 10.Please refer to point 3
mean waiting time 11.Please refer to point 3

12.The average waiting times for Pain Management services is
available on www.myplannedcare.nhs.uk We do not hold the
data relating to median and mean waiting times in the format
requested.

The information provided in this response is accurate as of 21 December 2023 and has been approved for release by Sarah
Truelove, Deputy Chief Executive and Chief Finance Officer for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB.




