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Reference: FOI.ICB-2324/339 
 
Subject: Orthodontic Waiting List in Primary Care 

I can confirm that the ICB does hold some of the information requested; please see responses below: 
 

QUESTION RESPONSE 

1. Which geographical area do you commission orthodontic 
services for? 

Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire 

2. Do you have a centralised referral system for orthodontic 
referrals? 

No 

3. If No to question 2, Where and How are the orthodontic 
referrals held? 

Referrals are made direct to individual practices in primary care and 
direct to Trusts in secondary care. 

4. Please provide me with the number of patients on the primary 
care waiting list for an Orthodontic assessment in your area? 

The ICB does not hold a central waiting list. Each practice holds their 
own list. 
 
However, data is collated from practices on a regular basis.  As at 
September 23 there were 6,765 patients on the combined lists 
awaiting assessment. 



 

2 

 

5. Please provide me the earliest date of referral for a patient 
awaiting an orthodontic assessment (i.e. the referral date for the 
patient waiting the longest for assessment)? 

From the data collated from practices in September 23, the longest 
wait for assessment was 151 weeks. 

6. Please provide with me with the number of patients awaiting 
an orthodontic assessment in excess of 18 weeks since the date 
of referral? 

The ICB does not hold this information 

7. Please provide with me with the number of patients awaiting 
an orthodontic assessment in excess of 52 weeks since the date 
of referral? 

The ICB does not hold this information 

8. Please provide me with the amount of orthodontic activity 
(number of UOAs) that you have commissioned within your area 
for primary care orthodontic treatment 

23/24 – 75,321 UOAs 

9. Please provide me with a list of your primary care orthodontic 
contract holders in your ICB 

See table attached 

10. Please provide the amount of orthodontic activity (number of 
UOAs) that each contract holder currently provides on a yearly 
basis. 

See table attached 

11. Please provide me with the date(s) when each of your 
primary care orthodontic contracts were commissioned. 

See table attached 
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12. Please provide me with the length(s) of each of your primary 
care contracts that you have currently commissioned. 

See table attached 

13. Please provide me with the date of your last orthodontic 
needs assessment carried out in your area and the geographical 
area(s) it covered 

The ICB does not hold this information 

14. Please provide me with a copy of the most up to date 
Orthodontic Needs Assessment document for the commissioned 
geographical area(s) 

The ICB does not hold this information  

15. What are the number of 12 year olds within your 
commissioning area? 

The ICB does not hold this information. This information may be 
available through the Office of National Statistics Home - Office for 

National Statistics (ons.gov.uk) 

 

Alternatively, the Local Authorities may hold this information: 
 
Bristol City Council - https://www.bristol.gov.uk/data-protection-
foi/freedom-of-information-foi 
 
North Somerset Council -  https://www.n-somerset.gov.uk/council-
democracy/data-protection-freedom-information/freedom-
information/about-freedom-information-foi 
    
South Gloucestershire Council - 
https://www.southglos.gov.uk/council-and-democracy/data-
protection-and-freedom-of-information/making-a-freedom-of-
information-request/ 

https://www.ons.gov.uk/
https://www.ons.gov.uk/
https://www.bristol.gov.uk/data-protection-foi/freedom-of-information-foi
https://www.bristol.gov.uk/data-protection-foi/freedom-of-information-foi
https://www.n-somerset.gov.uk/council-democracy/data-protection-freedom-information/freedom-information/about-freedom-information-foi
https://www.n-somerset.gov.uk/council-democracy/data-protection-freedom-information/freedom-information/about-freedom-information-foi
https://www.n-somerset.gov.uk/council-democracy/data-protection-freedom-information/freedom-information/about-freedom-information-foi
https://www.southglos.gov.uk/council-and-democracy/data-protection-and-freedom-of-information/making-a-freedom-of-information-request/
https://www.southglos.gov.uk/council-and-democracy/data-protection-and-freedom-of-information/making-a-freedom-of-information-request/
https://www.southglos.gov.uk/council-and-democracy/data-protection-and-freedom-of-information/making-a-freedom-of-information-request/
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The information provided in this response is accurate as of 28th December 2023 and has been approved for release by David 
Jarrett, Chief Delivery Officer for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB. 



Practice  Address Contracted 
UOAs 
23/24 

Contract 
start date 

Contract 
end date 

Whitetree 
Orthodontic Practice 

1-3 North View, 
Westbury Park, Bristol, 
Avon, BS6 7PT 

547 1/7/2011 N/A 

Whitetree 
Orthodontic Practice 

1-3 North View, 
Westbury Park, Bristol, 
Avon, BS6 7PT 

7,587 1/4/2011 N/A 

Passage House Dental 
Care 

227 Passage Road 

Henbury  
Bristol 

784 1/10/2008 N/A 

CLIFTON 
ORTHODONTICS 

26 Berkeley Square  
Clifton 

Bristol  
BS8 1HP 

5,938 1/10/2011 N/A 

Smile Solution ltd Smile Solution 

6 The Parade 

Shirehampton 

Bristol 
BS11 9TS 

9,106 1/04/2006 N/A 

Q Dental Care Limited 116 Pembroke Road, 
Bristol, Avon, BS8 3EW 

16,563 1/04/2008 N/A 

Bristol Orthodontics 63 High Street 
Kingswood 

Bristol 
BS15 4AD 

21,588 1/04/2008 N/A 

Stoke Gifford Dental 
Surgery 

4a-6a Ratcliffe Drive, 
Stoke Gifford, BS34 8UE 

753 1/4/2006 N/A 

Church Road Dental 
Practice 

269 Church Road, 
Redfield, 
Bristol, BS5 9HT 

743 1/1/2015 N/A 

Weston Orthodontic 
Centre 

Millbrook House, 141 
Milton Road, Weston 
Super Mare, Avon, BS22 
8AA 

9,876 1/4/2006 N/A 

Yate Dental Practice 2a North Walk 

Yate 

BS37 4AP 

1,612 1/4/2006 31/8/2023 

Bank Cottage Dental 
Practice 

14 Castle Street, 
Thornbury, Bristol, Avon, 
BS35 1HB 

233 1/02/2012 N/A 
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