Reference: FOI.ICB-2324/264

Subject: Child Sexual Abuse Support Services
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I can confirm that the ICB does not hold the information requested; please see responses below:

QUESTION

RESPONSE

1. What provider (or providers) delivers these services in
your ICS?

2. Does the model include support for families and carers?

3. On average, how many sessions does a CYP have from
entering treatment to discharge?

4. How many CYP has the service seen in:

2019/20
2020/21
2021/22
2022/23
2023/24 to date
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The ICB does not hold this information, this is not a service that is
commissioned by the ICB.

Local Authorities provide safeguarding and family/social support, the
three Local Authorities in the BNSSG area are as follows:

>

>

Bristol City Council - https://www.bristol.gov.uk/data-protection-
foi/freedom-of-information-foi

North Somerset Council - https://www.n-
somerset.gov.uk/council-democracy/data-protection-freedom-
information/freedom-information/about-freedom-information-foi

South Gloucestershire Council -
https://www.southglos.gov.uk/council-and-democracy/data-
protection-and-freedom-of-information/making-a-freedom-of-
information-request/

Avon and Somerset police provide support services for victims and
there are also support offers available through VCSE (voluntary,
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5. What is the spend on these services in: community or social enterprise organisation).
a. 2019/20 NHS England commission All age Sexual Violence Therapies Service
b. 2020/21 on behalf of Avon and Somerset. There is a menu of services
c. 2021/22 including rapid access to initial support and then a range of options to
d. 2022/23 meet the level of need and acuity for both adults and children.
e. 2023/24

The information provided in this response is accurate as of 12 October 2023 and has been approved for release by Sarah
Truelove, Deputy Chief Executive and Chief Finance Officer for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB.




