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Reference: FOI.ICB-2324/196 
 
Subject: Clinical Systems and Patient Check-in in Primary Care 

I can confirm that the ICB does hold some of the information requested; please see responses below: 
 

QUESTION RESPONSE 

1. ICB name Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire (BNSSG) 
2. How many of your GP surgeries have the following 

clinical system:  
 

a. SystmOne?  
b. Emis?  
c. Other? 

SystmOne - 0 
Emis - 76 
Other - 0 

3. Who currently funds patient arrival check in screens for 
your GP surgeries?   
 
If ICB Funded:  

1. Do you have a current contract in place?  
2. Who is the provider/supplier?  
3. What is the contract end date?  
4. How long was the contract for?  
5. What was the value of the contract?  
6. Do you have any plans to renew the contract?  

The ICB does not hold this information - practices self-fund. 
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7. Why do you order from this provider/supplier?  

4. If you do not have a contract in place:  

1. Do you order ad-hoc?  
2. Who is the provider/supplier?  
3. How many do you order on an annual basis?  
4. What is the average value of an order?  
5. Why do you order from this provider/supplier?  

The ICB does not hold this information - practices self-fund. 

5. Do you have any plans to procure patient arrival check in 
screens for your GP surgeries in the future? If so:  

a. When?  
b. How many/what is the budget?  
c. What features/functionality are you looking for, if 

any?  

The ICB does not hold this information - practices self-fund. 

6. Do you order through a framework, if so, which one?  The ICB does not hold this information - practices self-fund. 

7. Please can you list the PCNs which fall within your ICB?  

HealthWest 
Affinity 
Northern Arc 
Concord & Mendip Vale 
Severnvale 
4PCN 
Network4 
The Stokes 
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Yate & Frampton 
BridgeView 
Swift 
Connexus 
Bristol Inner City  
FABB 
FOSS 
Phoenix 
Mendip Vale 
Gordano Valley 
Tyntesfield 
Pier Health 

8. Who is the IT Programme Manager within the Digital/IT 
Directorate within your ICB?   

Deborah El-Eayed – Director of Transformation and CDIO (Chief 
Digital Information Officer)  
 
Head of Digital Transformation and Portfolios, bnssg.digital@nhs.net  

9. Please supply a list of all Digital and Transformation Lead 
PCN Leads within your region?  

The ICB does not hold a list of Digital and Transformation Leads at 
present.  

 
The information provided in this response is accurate as of 30 August 2023 and has been approved for release by David Jarrett, 
Director of Integrated and Primary Care and Deborah El-Sayed, Director of Transformation CDIO for NHS Bristol, North Somerset 
and South Gloucestershire ICB. 


