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Reference: FOI.ICB-2324/124 
 
Subject: Spending on inpatient beds LDA 
 
I can confirm that the ICB does not hold the information requested; please see responses below: 
 

QUESTION RESPONSE 

1) How much has the ICB spent on ICB-commissioned inpatient 
beds for people with a learning disability and/or autism (who 
meet the NHS Digital Assuring Transformation criteria: 'If a 
person is in a specialist hospital bed (either MH or LD) and that 
person has a Learning Disability or Autism' *).  

Please include spending for the current ICB footprint, and for 
any CCGs that formerly operated in the current ICB footprint, for 
the following time periods: 

a. April 2018 – March 2019 

b. April 2019- March 2020 

c. April 2020 – March 2021 

d. April 2021 – March 2022 

e. April 2022 – March 2023 

The ICB invests in LD inpatient services as part of the block contract 

with our provider. The ICB does not hold this information. The 

Provider would hold the information on Inpatient costs and spend. 

The provider is Avon and Wiltshire Mental Health Partnership NHS 

Trust (AWP): awp.freedomofinformation@nhs.net 
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*https://digital.nhs.uk/data-and-information/data-collections-and-
data-sets/data-collections/assuring-transformation#the-in-scope-
definition 

 

 
The information provided in this response is accurate as of 11th July 2023 and has been approved for release by Sarah Truelove, 
Deputy Chief Executive and Chief Finance Officer for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB. 
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