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Reference: FOI.ICB-2324/005 
 
Subject: ADHD Screening (Adults and Children) 
 
I can confirm that the ICB does not hold the information requested; please see responses below: 
 

QUESTION RESPONSE 

1. Do you use screening before referring children to be 
assessed for ADHD. 

Definition being as per NHS: 

      Screening: a triage 

process, using standardised tools and/or agreed 
processes and carried out by experienced Liaison 
and Diversion practitioners.· 

      Assessment including 

specialist assessment: carried out by someone 
with a specific professional mandate, i.e. with 
requisite professional skills. 

If yes, when did you introduce screening? 

BNSSG ICB does not hold this information. We advise you to contact 
the providers Sirona care and health and Avon and Wiltshire Mental 
Health Partnership NHS Trust (AWP); 
 
Sirona - Sirona.hello@nhs.net 

AWP - awp.freedomofinformation@nhs.net / 
https://www.awp.nhs.uk/contact-us/freedom-information 
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2. For the years 2020,2021 and 2022 please provide the 
following broken down by calendar year. 

i) Number of individuals who received screening. 

ii) Number of individuals who were then referred for 
assessment. 

3. Do you use screening before referring Adults to be 
assessed for ADHD. 

Definition being as per NHS:· 

      Screening: a triage 

process, using standardised tools and/or agreed 
processes and carried out by experienced Liaison 
and Diversion practitioners. 

      Assessment including 

specialist assessment: carried out by someone 
with a specific professional mandate, i.e. with 
requisite professional skills. 

If yes what year did you introduce screening. 
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4. For the years 2020,2021 and 2022 please provide the 
following broken down by calendar year. 

i) Number of individuals who received screening. 

ii) Number of individuals who were then referred for 
assessment. 

 
The information provided in this response is accurate as of 13 April 2023 and has been approved for release by Sarah Truelove, 
Deputy Chief Executive and Chief Finance Officer for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB. 


