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Reference: FOI.ICB-2223/079 
 
Subject: Care Homes/Dentists/Pharmacy Estates 
 
I can confirm that the ICB does not hold the information requested; please see responses below: 
 

QUESTION RESPONSE 

Care Homes 
 

1. List any care homes that are known to have incurred 
expenditure on their property or increased physical 
floor space since January 2020. 

2. List any care homes that are known to be currently 
increasing or changing physical floor space, or are 
planning to do so in the next couple of years. 

Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire Integrated Care 
Board (BNSSG ICB) does not hold this information.  

Dentists 
 

1. List any dentists that are known to have incurred 
expenditure on their property or increased physical 
floor space since January 2020. 

2. List any dentists that are known to be currently 
increasing or changing physical floor space or are 
planning to do so in the next couple of years. 

Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire Integrated Care 
Board (BNSSG ICB) does not hold this information.  
 
We advise you to contact NHS England, contact details can be found 
via the following link: https://www.england.nhs.uk/contact-us/foi/ Pharmacies 

1. List any pharmacies that are known to have incurred 
expenditure on their property or increased physical 
floor space since January 2020. 
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2. List any pharmacies that are known to be currently 
increasing or changing physical floor space, or are 
planning to do so in the next couple of years. 

 
The information provided in this response is accurate as of 21 October 2022 and has been approved for release by Sarah 
Truelove, Deputy Chief Executive and Chief Finance Officer for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB. 


