Reference: FOL.ICB-2223/050

Subject: Maternity/Health Visits During Pandemic

I can confirm that the ICB does not hold the information requested; please see responses below:
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1. How many parents gave birth between March 2020 and April

2. How many health visitors were responsible for new parents
and newborns between March 2020 and April 20217

3. How many health visits to new parents were conducted
between March 2020 and April 20217

4. Could | also have the data for the above three questions for
the time between March 2019 and March 20207?

Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire Integrated Care
Board (BNSSG ICB) does not hold this information.

The health visiting service is commissioned by the three local authorities:

Bristol City Council - https://www.bristol.gov.uk/data-protection-

foi/freedom-of-information-foi

North Somerset Council - https://www.n-somerset.gov.uk/council-
democracy/data-protection-freedom-information/freedom-

information/about-freedom-information-foi

South Gloucestershire Council - https://www.southglos.gov.uk/council-
and-democracy/data-protection-and-freedom-of-information/making-a-

freedom-of-information-request/

The information provided in this response is accurate as of 21 September 2022 and has been approved for release by Deborah EI-
Sayed, Director of Transformation and Chief Digital Information Officer for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire

ICB.




