Reference: FOI.ICB-2223/034

Subject: Long COVID Clinics

| can confirm that the ICB does not hold the information requested; please see responses below:
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QUESTION

RESPONSE

a) By Phone or video call

b) In person

a) By Phone or video call

1. Please state the name of your Health Trust

2. Please state how many Long COVID Clinics cover
patients in your Health Trust, and please name them all.

3. How many Long COVID patients have had an initial
consultation with a Long COVID Clinic in your Trust, and
please break down how this was done

4. How many Long COVID patients went onto have a follow
up appointment with a Long COVID Clinic in your Trust,
and please break down how this was done.

Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire Integrated Care
Board does not hold this information.

We advise you to contact the provider Sirona care and health:
Sirona.hello@nhs.net
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b) In person

For questions 3 & 4, If possible, please state if the initial
appointment, then follow up appointment was by phone or in
person and vice versa.

5. How many Long COVID patients were screened for blood
clots or micro clots at a Long COVID Clinic within your
Trust

6. How many Long COVID Patients have died with a blood
or micro clot since being under a Long COVID clinic
within your Trust

7. Of those who died were they identified as having a blood
or micro clot?

The information provided in this response is accurate as of 10 August 2022 and has been approved for release by Jon Lund,
Deputy Chief Finance Officer for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB.




