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Reference: FOI.ICB-2223/233 
 
Subject: Maternal Vaccinations 
 
I can confirm that the ICB does not hold the information requested; please see responses below: 
 

QUESTION RESPONSE 

1.    Can you please provide the number of sites within your 
organisation that provide the following services:       

 Tdap (Pertussis)/whooping cough vaccination to pregnant 
women: hospital-based sites  

 Tdap (Pertussis)/whooping cough vaccination to pregnant 
women: community-based sites  

 Influenza vaccination to pregnant women: hospital-based 
sites  

 Influenza vaccination to pregnant women: community-
based sites  

BNSSG ICB (Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire 
Integrated Care Board) does not hold this information.  
 
Maternal vaccinations are commissioned by NHS England, we 
advise you to contact NHSE directly for further information: 
https://www.england.nhs.uk/contact-us/foi/ 
 
You could also contact the acute trusts North Bristol NHS Trust 
(NBT) and University Hospitals Bristol and Weston NHS Foundation 
Trust (UHBW), as follows: 
 
NBT: https://www.nbt.nhs.uk/about-us/information-
governance/freedom-information/request-information  
 
UHBW: https://www.uhbw.nhs.uk/p/how-we-use-your-data/freedom-
of-information-foi-requests 

2.    Of the total numbers of Healthcare Professionals that 
recommend/raise conversations regarding the Tdap 
(pertussis)/whooping cough vaccination to pregnant women 
across your ICS, what is the estimated % of each of the 
following types of HCPs: 

 Practice/community nurse  
 Community Midwife  
 GP  
 Hospital Nurse/Midwife 
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 Hospital doctor  
3.    Of the total numbers of Healthcare Professionals that 
deliver the Tdap (pertussis) /whooping cough vaccination to 
pregnant women across your ICS, what is the estimated % of 
each of the following types of HCPs: 

 Practice/community nurse  
 Community Midwife  
 GP  
 Hospital Nurse/Midwife 
 Hospital doctor  

4.    Of the total numbers of Healthcare Professionals that 
recommend/raise conversations regarding the influenza 
vaccination to pregnant women across your ICS, what is the 
estimated % of each of the following types of HCPs: 

 Practice/community nurse  
 Community Midwife  
 GP  
 Hospital Nurse/Midwife 
 Hospital doctor  

5.    Of the total numbers of Healthcare Professionals that 
deliver the influenza vaccination to pregnant women across your 
ICS, what is the estimated % of each of the following types of 
HCPs:   

 Practice/community nurse  
 Community Midwife  
 GP  
 Hospital Nurse/Midwife 
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 Hospital doctor 
6.    In the latest 3 months, how many vaccinations has your 
organisation delivered to pregnant women ONLY for:  

 Tdap (Pertussis)/whooping cough vaccinations - at 
hospital-based sites  

 Tdap (Pertussis)/whooping cough vaccinations - at 
community-based sites  

 Influenza vaccinations - at hospital-based sites  
 Influenza vaccinations - at community-based sites  

 
The information provided in this response is accurate as of 15 March2023 and has been approved for release by David Jarrett, 
Director of Integrated and Primary Care for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB. 


