

Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire Integrated Care Board

Reference: FOI.ICB-2223/149

Subject: Post Covid Assessment Service & Dara Collection

I can confirm that the ICB **does not hold the information requested**; please see responses below:

QUESTION		RESPONSE
1.	When did your post COVID (long COVID) assessment service become operational?	Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire Integrated Care Board (BNSSG ICB) does not hold this information. We advise you to contact the provider Sirona care and health - <u>Sirona.hello@nhs.net</u>
2.	A copy of the operational policy for your post COVID (long COVID) assessment service	
3.	The titles of the rows and columns of your central database/ spreadsheet on the referrals received, patients seen and outcomes of assessments	
4.	What information do you hold on the occupations of people referred with post COVID (long COVID) syndrome?	



Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire

Integrated Care Board

5.	Do you record how many of the people referred are current or former NHS workers?
6.	What data do you submit to NHS England and or other central bodies about the work of your service and the characteristics of the patients who you treat?
7.	To where are patients referred if assessment concludes that they need rehabilitation for post COVID (long COVID) syndrome?

The information provided in this response is accurate as of 28 December 2022 and has been approved for release by Sarah Truelove, Deputy Chief Executive and Chief Finance Officer for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB.