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Subject: Individual Funding Requests received for treatment of OCD/BDD

| can confirm that the ICB does hold some of the information requested; please see responses below:

records go back) AND the number of those that were successful
- when there was a diagnosis of BDD.

QUESTION RESPONSE
1)Total numbers of Individual Funding Requests (IFRs) received

for treatment at an adult national and specialist OCD/BDD

service per year, for the past 20 years (or however far the Zero

2)Total numbers of Individual Funding Requests (IFRs) received
for treatment at an adult national and specialist OCD/BDD
service per year, for the past 20 years (or however far the
records go back) AND the number of those that were
successful.

The number of Individual Funding Requests received for each year is
less than 10; therefore they have not been included as this could
potentially make the patients identifiable.

FOI requests and responses are publicly available and therefore
reference to personal identifiable data has not been included. The
ICB has applied the Section 40 (Personal data) exemption to any
data which identifies patients. The data requested constitutes health
related records and therefore the ICB is unable to disclose this data.

3) How many adults with a diagnosis of body dysmorphic
disorder (BDD) have been referred to tertiary specialist services
for treatment per year for the past 20 years (or however far the
records go back)

Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire Integrated Care
Board (BNSSG ICB) does not hold this information.
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4) Total numbers of Individual Funding Requests (IFRs)
received for treatment at a child and adolescent national and
specialist OCD service per year, for the past 20 years (or
however far the records go back) AND the number of those that
were successful - when there was a diagnosis of BDD.

Zero

5) Total numbers of Individual Funding Requests (IFRs)
received for treatment at a child and adolescent national and
specialist OCD service per year, for the past 20 years (or
however far the records go back) AND the number of those that
were successful

The number of Individual Funding Requests received for each year is
less than 10; therefore they have not been included as this could
potentially make the patients identifiable.

FOI requests and responses are publicly available and therefore
reference to personal identifiable data has not been included. The
ICB has applied the Section 40 (Personal data) exemption to any
data which identifies patients. The data requested constitutes health
related records and therefore the ICB is unable to disclose this data.

6) How many children/adolescents with a diagnosis of body
dysmorphic disorder (BDD) have been referred to tertiary
specialist services for treatment per year for the past 20 years
(or however far the records go back)

The ICB does not hold this information.

The information provided in this response is accurate as of 15 August 2022 and has been approved for release by Lisa Manson,
Director of Commissioning for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB.




