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Reference: FOI.ICB-2223/005 
 
Subject: Adults and Children’s ADHD Referrals and Waiting Times 
 
I can confirm that the ICB does not hold the information requested; please see responses below: 
 

QUESTION RESPONSE 

1. The current wait time for an undiagnosed child (under the 
age of 18) to see a psychiatrist for ADHD after being referred 
from a GP on the NHS.  

 
Please can you also provide the average wait time for each of 
the last five years, if doing so won’t push this request over the 
cost limit.  Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire Integrated Care 

Board (BNSSG ICB) ICB does not hold this information.   
 
We advise you to contact Avon and Wiltshire Mental Health 
Partnership NHS Trust (AWP) – https://www.awp.nhs.uk/contact-
us/freedom-information 

2. The current wait time for an undiagnosed adult to see a 
psychiatrist for ADHD after being referred from a GP on the 
NHS.  

 
Please can you also provide the average wait time for each of 
the last five years, if doing so won’t push this request over the 
cost limit. 
3. The number of children (under the age of 18) with an ADHD 

diagnosis. Please provide the total and (if available) a 
breakdown by gender.  
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Please can you also provide this same information for each of 
the last five years, if doing so won’t push this request over the 
cost limit. 
4. The number of adults (over the aged of 18 with an ADHD 

diagnosis. Please provide the total and (if available) a 
breakdown by gender.  

 
Please can you also provide this same information for each of 
the last five years, if doing so won’t push this request over the 
cost limit. 
5. How many adult assessments were done in the last year. 

Please provide the total and (if available) a breakdown by 
gender.  

 
Clarification received 07/07/2022: It is meant to say 'how 
many adult/children ADHD assessments were done in the 
last year?' 
 
Please can you also provide this same information for each of 
the prior five years, if doing so won’t push this request over the 
cost limit. 
6. How many children assessments were done in the last year. 

Please provide the total and (if available) a breakdown by 
gender.  

 
Clarification received 07/07/2022: It is meant to say 'how 
many adult/children ADHD assessments were done in the 
last year?' 
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Please can you also provide this same information for each of 
the prior five years, if doing so won’t push this request over the 
cost limit. 

7. In the last year how many adult ADHD assessment referrals 
have been rejected. Please provide the total and (if available) 
a breakdown by gender.  

 
Please can you also provide this same information for each of 
the prior five years, if doing so won’t push this request over the 
cost limit. 
8. In the last year how many children ADHD assessment 

referrals have been rejected. Please provide the total and (if 
available) a breakdown by gender.  

 
Please can you also provide this same information for each of 
the prior five years, if doing so won’t push this request over the 
cost limit. 
9. In the last year how many adults with an ADHD diagnosis 

had a death recorded as suicide. Please provide the total 
and (if available) a breakdown by gender.  

 
Please can you also provide this same information for each of 
the prior five years, if doing so won’t push this request over the 
cost limit. 
10. In the last year how many children with an ADHD diagnosis 

had a death recorded as suicide. Please provide the total 
and (if available) a breakdown by gender.  
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Please can you also provide this same information for each of 
the prior five years, if doing so won’t push this request over the 
cost limit. 

11. In the last year how many adults on the waiting list for an 
ADHD diagnosis had a death recorded as suicide. Please 
provide the total and (if available) a breakdown by gender.  

 
Please can you also provide this same information for each of 
the prior five years, if doing so won’t push this request over the 
cost limit. 
12. In the last year how many children on the waiting list for an 

ADHD diagnosis had a death recorded as suicide. Please 
provide the total and (if available) a breakdown by gender.  
 

Please can you also provide this same information for each of 
the prior five years, if doing so won’t push this request over the 
cost limit. 

 
The information provided in this response is accurate as of 26 July 2022 and has been approved for release by Helena Fuller, 
Deputy Director of Commissioning (Contracts and Performance) for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire 
ICB. 
 


